
From: Gary S. Gevisser 
Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2007 5:06 PM PT 
To: Adam Tucker 
Cc: rest; JRK@class-action-law.com; itiswell; NO LONGER PRACTICING, thank G-d, 
Dr. John BIG BEN Stewart MD of Sharp Memorial Hospital - aka The Sperm Donor aka 
The It; George Hurst Esq. - Lawyer-liar for Dr. John Ben Stewart aka Sperm Donor; 
Deborah "Aggressive" Sturman Esq.; William S. Lerach Esq. - Chairman of the Firm; 
Robert H. Frank - Profefessor of Economics - Cornell University ; Roberto Quinones - 
Public Defender - Jose Eddie Pollard; Selwyn Gerber - Economist - CPA; Roy Essakow - 
Executive Marc Rich Holdings; Conrad Wolff; Hilary-Bill DeBeers-Rhodes Scholar 
Clinton; Howard Schultz - Founder, Chairman and Global Strategist for Starbucks; 
Steven Lee Parkinson - Mothercare - Middleast; Professor Trevor Jones - Economics 
Dept - University of Natal, South Africa; Tony Leon MP - Leader of the Democratic 
Alliance - Republic of South Africa; Leah Brandon - KFI 640 AM; Jay McMichael - CNN 
photojournalist; Ivan Oshry Esq.; artbell-coast; King Golden Jr. Esq.; Camilo Sanchez; 
Eliot Spitzer - Governor of New York State - Former Attorney General of New York State 
; Guy De Chazal - Partner Morgan Stanley; Laurie Black - Strategic Partners with 
Southwest Strategies, Steve Alexander Group,; Fung, Linda; Professor Rabbi Abner 
Weiss; Randall Kaplan. co-founder of AKAMAI with Daniel Lewin - 911 victim - Member 
of Sayeret Matkal - Elite Israeli Special Forces unit; Professor Jeffrey Sachs - Columbia 
University; Valerie Schulte Esq. - National Association of Broadcasters; 
yqian@econ.berkeley.edu; John Ziegler - KFI 640 AM "More Stimulating Talk Sh*t 
Radio" [sic]; Dr. Laura Family; Mossad; jimandjoe@ussliberty.com; United States Justice 
Department 
Subject: Ask Jeffrey... 
 
in your own words and without bothering to have him comment on “Al-Jazeera Report 
Shows American Citizen Training Islamist Militants... what prevents him from “riding 
the coattails” of the US$4 billion his colleague, DAAC criminal Melvyn Weiss Esquire 
and my immediate family’s very close friend, Deborah Sturman extorted from low level 
DAAC operatives in settling matters for those so very few remaining Jewish slave 
laborers of the Holocaust? 
 
Perhaps, but only if you agree less is more, and less for the brain dead, also mention 
that I have now mentioned to you that his law firm’s foray in to the highly lucrative Anti-
Trust arena, beginning with going after specifically importers of chemicals in to the U.S., 
again in violation of our sacrosanct Anti-Trust laws, is so extraordinarily lucrative 
because very skilled and experienced litigators such as Mr. JRK also want time to relax 
and enjoy life just like us 3 ants, and do so by “riding the coattails” of the Feds when, to 
repeat, going after those most flagrant violators of our so very sacred Anti-Trust/Anti-
Price Fixing/Anti-Competition laws that the DAAC have a whale of a time poking fun at, 
all at the expense of not only America’s increasingly poor; but remember, America 
represents some 4.2% of the world’s population and the remaining 95.8% or so are 
overwhelming poor; but just because you are poor does not mean you have be either 
dirty or without table manners or stupid or out of shape both physically and mentally. 
 
Not to forget where you first heard the name Engelhard’s Mineral and Chemicals out of 
Newark, New Jersey, two words. 
 
The discombobulated masses also include those miniscule living the good life without 
having to work very hard including of course Trust Fund children having no difficulty 
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given their poor education-breeding buying into Edward Jay Epstein’s nonsense about 
Englehard “forced” to ship gold bullion in the form of art objects-statues out of South 
Africa to get around South Africa’s nonsense “foreign exchange-currency laws”, 
destination Hong Kong. 
 
Fricken stupid and lazy westerners beginning of course with us Americans who are 
raised to “feel good about ourselves” do “feel good about ourselves” when hearing that 
the gold stolen from South Africa as a result of enslaving, torturing and murdering tens of 
millions of so very colorful South Africans was somehow not really benefiting the 
conscienceless Americans living off one most extraordinarily bloodied Trust Fund. 
 
So here is Jeffrey having you “beat on” DAAC controlled wholesale-retail diamond 
money laundering stores whose owners if they were to cooperate fully will at best be 
fortunate enough to dig ditches but they too only die once. 
 
Why not ask Jeffrey what his wife Marcy is doing tomorrow and even if she still has to 
supervise her two handfuls of staff taking care of their awesome grounds perhaps during 
her 10 minute morning break and if that isn’t enough time than perhaps her afternoon 10 
minute break, don’t dare think of interrupting Marcy’s lunch with her girlfriends who rely 
on one another to keep tabs on their husband’s girlfriends, Jeffrey very possibly the only 
exception, to call Jeffrey, remembering to be courteous when speaking with Kim Jones 
the receptionist and remind Jeffrey that Engelhard Minerals and Chemicals out of 
Newark, one word, New Jersey, two words, is and has been now for more than a century 
a flagrant DAAC importer of chemicals into and OUT OF the United States 
DESTINATION DAAC mining operations throughout the world including South Africa. 
 
I heard about this tame gorilla that shakes peoples hands. Do you think we could hire 
him so that when we do get around to videotaping my explanation of The Diamond 
Invention I could not only change seats with him but I think having him around will keep 
me constantly smiling which according to Queen Ant Marie is silly since she says there 
is nothing in the least bit funny about the Diamond Invention. 
 
Just because she is the Queen Ant does it mean that I have to always listen to what she 
says? 
 
Perhaps, again if there is time, Marcy can also mention to Jeffrey that South Africa sits 
on the most southern point of the African continent but don’t necessarily assume this 
since we are no doubt in the midst of the polar-reversal which could have what we know 
as the north pole becoming the south. 
 
Marcy who before marrying Jeffrey in a most elaborate and wonderful wedding 
ceremony where of course Marie and I were “honored guests” was the Chief Marketing 
Officer of the Offense-Defense contractor Science Applications International Corporation 
and would understand the term “running a flag up the pole”. 
 
I am not sure where I was going with that. 
 
You will recall SAIC hired University of Virginia Law School graduate King Golden Jr. 
Esq. a left of left wing Democrat as their General Counsel which is when I first “ran into” 
this “bosom buddy” of DAAC master spy banker Roger W. Robinson. 
 



Not to mention yet again that King Golden Jr. Esq. married his Norman Rockwell figure 
wife at a ceremony on the deck of SAIC’s world headquarters in La Jolla, California. 
 
Not really difficult to figure out anything once understanding the ingenious workings of 
the mind the first indicator of the Supernatural beginning with realizing that it is the idiots 
who think their smarts belong to them who pay others to make laws that include hiring 
the dumbest of Americans like King Golden’s wife Berkeley PH.D Sarah Golden heading 
up programs like Head Start in Washington DC, doing the most brilliant job of dummying 
down America that has as logic would dictate the dumbest of Americans, the 
intelligentsia-academia, the new corrupt church, blaming Hispanics the hardest and most 
non-violent workers for America’s Norman Rockwell painting lifestyle within moments of 
total collapse. 
 
Never to forget China has not only some nearly 500 million very wired Chinese but 
another 1 billion farmers such as those we met on our 5 Star going on minus 1 star 
cruise of Yangtze last summer who got a great kick while earning very little money 
showing us their extraordinary muscular 

 
skeleton system 



 
when pulling us mostly very overweight westerners along in the canoes upstream on a 
tributary of the Yangtze; a good thing that on occasion water would splash right next to 
the women and not forget the gay men who would quickly make mention to their 
partners of the wet spot to the side. 
 

 
Never to forget that every foreigner who visits China mostly plans their trip in advance. 
 
Never to forget that those foreigners who don’t plan their trips in advance can have a 
really tough time figuring things out. 
 



Never to forget the extraordinarily disproportionate amount of Israelis who have been 
visiting China especially over the past 2 decades. 
 
Not to mention yet again the consensus of our very good English speaking private 
guides numbering some 10 or so including their supervisors who we “ran into” on 
occasion, was that approximately 30% of their customers were Israelis whose numbers 
total some 6 million, a percentage so small it causes most calculators to “error”. 
 
Never to forget that Chinese government officials have advance warning to display.   
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